
SEVEN INNOVATION AND
CREATIVITY PRACTICES

FOR 2025

Insights from “Everything Connects” 



1

Why: Creativity thrives in environments
where diverse perspectives come
together.

How: Break down organizational silos,
encourage cross-disciplinary
collaboration, and create open forums
for idea-sharing. Use tools and platforms
that promote real-time collaboration.

FOSTER A CULTURE OF
COLLABORATION
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2 ALIGN INNOVATION
WITH PURPOSE
Why: Innovations rooted in a shared
purpose are more impactful and
sustainable.

How: Ensure that all creative efforts
align with your organization’s mission
and contribute to solving real-world
problems, from sustainability to social
equity.
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3 EMBRACE SYSTEMS
THINKING
Why: Understanding how parts of a
system interact allows for holistic
innovation.

How: Train teams to think beyond
individual projects, considering how
innovations impact broader ecosystems,
industries, and societies.
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4 CULTIVATE A SAFE
SPACE FOR
EXPERIMENTATION
Why: Fear of failure stifles creativity,
while a safe environment encourages
bold ideas.

How: Establish systems for rapid
prototyping, testing, and iterating
without fear of punitive consequences
for unsuccessful attempts.
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5 HARNESS TECHNOLOGY
FOR CREATIVE
AMPLIFICATION
Why: AI, big data, and other
technologies offer unprecedented tools
for ideation and execution.

How: Leverage AI for data-driven
insights, automate routine tasks to free
up creative time, and use technology to
visualize and refine innovative concepts.
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6 PRIORITIZE
CONTINUOUS LEARNING
AND CURIOSITY
Why: Staying innovative requires keeping
up with trends and exploring new
knowledge areas.

How: Encourage ongoing education,
bring in external experts, and reward
curiosity. Create opportunities for
employees to engage in workshops,
hackathons, or cross-industry exchanges.
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7 CONNECT CREATIVITY
TO EMOTIONAL
INTELLIGENCE
Why: Emotional intelligence enhances
collaboration and the ability to empathize
with end-users.

How: Train leaders and teams in
empathy-driven design thinking and
involve customers or stakeholders in the
creative process to ensure innovations
resonate deeply.
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ORDER EVERYTHING CONNECTS 

Proceeds from the book sales go to
cancer research.

ORDER
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